
Item 601127

The  V104  wall  rail  is  manufactured  in
stainless  steel  and  has  pre-drilled  holes  for
quick  wall  installation.  The  wall  rail  is  a  C-
rail  and  is  adapted  to  V103  brackets  and
V107  shelves.  Length  600mm.

Item 601174

The  V104  wall  rail  is  manufactured  in
stainless  steel  and  has  pre-drilled  holes  for
quick  wall  installation.  The  wall  rail  is  a  C-
rail  and  is  adapted  to  V103  brackets  and
V107  shelves.  Length  1000mm.

Item 601176

The  V104  wall  rail  is  manufactured  in
stainless  steel  and  has  pre-drilled  holes  for
quick  wall  installation.  The  wall  rail  is  a  C-
rail  and  is  adapted  to  V103  brackets  and
V107  shelves.  Length  2000mm.

Item 601215

The  V104  wall  rail  is  manufactured  in
stainless  steel  and  has  pre-drilled  holes  for
quick  wall  installation.  The  wall  rail  is  a  C-
rail  and  is  adapted  to  V103  brackets  and
V107  shelves.  Length  1500mm.

Item 601305

The  V104  wall  rail  is  manufactured  in
stainless  steel  and  has  pre-drilled  holes  for
quick  wall  installation.  The  wall  rail  is  a  C-



rail  and  is  adapted  to  V103  brackets  and
V107  shelves.  Length  800mm.

Item 601126

The  V104  wall  rail  is  manufactured  in
stainless  steel  and  has  pre-drilled  holes  for
quick  wall  installation.  The  wall  rail  is  a  C-
rail  and  is  adapted  to  V103  brackets  and
V107  shelves.  Length  400mm.

Item 601353

The  V104  wall  rail  is  manufactured  in
stainless  steel  and  has  pre-drilled  holes  for
quick  wall  installation.  The  wall  rail  is  a  C-
rail  and  is  adapted  to  V103  brackets  and
V107  shelves.  Length  1800mm.

Specifications

Item Number 601127

Function To wall

Item Color Stainless

Material Stainless steel 1.4301

Size L600

Surface Polish

Item Number 601174

Function To wall

Item Color Stainless



Material Stainless steel 1.4301

Size L1

Surface Polish

Item Number 601176

Function To wall

Item Color Stainless

Material Stainless steel 1.4301

Size L2

Surface Polish

Item Number 601215

Function To wall

Item Color Stainless

Material Stainless steel 1.4301

Size L15

Surface Polish

Item Number 601305

Function To wall

Item Color Stainless

Material Stainless steel 1.4301



Size L800

Surface Polish

Item Number 601126

Function To wall

Item Color Stainless

Material Stainless steel 1.4301

Size L400

Surface Polish

Item Number 601353

Function To wall

Item Color Stainless

Material Stainless steel 1.4301

Size L18

Surface Polish
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